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Degree: Master of Business Administration 
Major: International Business Management 

ABSTRACT 

The aviation industry is a critical sector that significantly contributes to the global 
economy by facilitating international trade, tourism, and connectivity. The aviation 
industry heavily relies on flight attendants, whose career development significantly 
impacts service quality and operational efficiency. This study addresses the need to 
enhance career satisfaction and development prospects among flight attendants in 
Eastern China Airlines. The objectives of this study were: 1) To examine the 
relationship between career training and career development prospects of flight 
attendants in Eastern China Airlines, 2) To examine the relationship between work 
environment and career development prospects of flight attendants in Eastern China 
Airlines, 3) To examine the relationship between support systems and career 
development prospects of flight attendants in Eastern China Airlines.  

This study adopted the quantitative research method, utilizing a structured survey, 
distributing questionnaires to 350 flight attendants, with 300 valid responses analyzed. 
The study tested three hypotheses using Pearson correlation and regression analyses, 
and confirmed that: 1) there is a significant positive relationship between career training 
and career development prospects, 2) there is a significant positive relationship between 
work environment and career development prospects, 3) there is a significant positive 
relationship between support systems and career development prospects. 

Based on these findings, the study recommends enhancing career training 
programs and improving the work environment and support systems. These strategies 
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aim to foster a more motivated, satisfied, and productive workforce, ultimately 
benefiting Eastern China Airlines. 

 
Keywords: career development theory, career training, work environment, support 
systems 
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Chapter 1 Introduction 
 
1.1 Background of the Study 

The aviation industry is a critical sector that significantly contributes to the global 
economy by facilitating international trade, tourism, and connectivity. Flight attendants, 
as frontline employees, play a crucial role in ensuring passenger safety, comfort, and 
overall service quality. In the context of Eastern China Airlines, the career development 
of flight attendants is essential for maintaining high service standards and operational 
efficiency. 

 
Career development in the aviation industry involves various factors, including 

career training, work environment, and support systems. These factors collectively 
influence flight attendants' career satisfaction and progression. According to Chen and 
Liu (2019), effective career training programs are instrumental in enhancing employees' 
skills and competencies, thereby increasing their job satisfaction and career 
advancement opportunities. 

 
the work environment significantly impacts employees' performance and career 

growth. A supportive and conducive work environment fosters positive work attitudes, 
reduces stress, and enhances job satisfaction (Zhang & Wang, 2018). In a study 
conducted by Li and Zhao (2020), it was found that a healthy work environment is 
positively correlated with higher employee retention and better career outcomes in the 
airline industry. 

 
Support systems, including managerial support, peer support, and organizational 

policies, are also vital for career development. These systems provide the necessary 
resources and encouragement for employees to pursue career growth opportunities. 
Wang (2017) highlighted that robust support systems lead to improved job performance 
and higher career satisfaction among flight attendants. 

 
In the context of Eastern China Airlines, understanding the factors influencing 

flight attendants' career development is crucial for designing effective HR policies and 
training programs. This study aims to investigate the impact of career training, work 
environment, and support systems on the career development of flight attendants in 
Eastern China Airlines. By examining these factors, the study seeks to provide insights 
into improving career development prospects for flight attendants. 
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1.2 Problems of the Study 

The rapid expansion of the aviation industry has placed significant pressure on 
airlines to maintain high standards of service quality while ensuring efficient 
operational management. In Eastern China Airlines, the career development of flight 
attendants has encountered several issues, primarily related to the implementation and 
management of training programs, work environment enhancements, and support 
systems. 

 
One of the key problems is the inconsistent and often inadequate provision of 

career training programs. Despite the airline's efforts to offer training, there are notable 
discrepancies in the availability and quality of these programs. This inconsistency leads 
to varying levels of competency among flight attendants, directly affecting their career 
development prospects. According to Wu and Zhang (2018), such inconsistencies in 
training provision can result in decreased employee morale and increased turnover rates. 

 
Additionally, the work environment within Eastern China Airlines has been 

reported to suffer from issues such as high stress levels, inadequate rest facilities, and 
insufficient support from management. These factors contribute to a less-than-optimal 
work environment, which hinders flight attendants' ability to perform effectively and 
develop their careers. Liu and Chen (2017) found that poor work environments are 
closely linked to higher levels of job dissatisfaction and burnout among flight attendants. 

 
Furthermore, the support systems in place are often perceived as insufficient or 

inaccessible. Flight attendants frequently report a lack of adequate managerial support 
and peer collaboration, which are essential for career development. This lack of support 
can leave employees feeling isolated and undervalued, reducing their motivation to 
pursue career growth. Yang and Li (2019) emphasized that robust support systems are 
crucial for fostering a positive work culture and enhancing career development 
opportunities. 

 
The Career Development Theory offers valuable insights into addressing these 

problems. This theory posits that career development is influenced by a combination of 
individual efforts, organizational support, and environmental factors. By applying this 
theory, Eastern China Airlines can develop comprehensive strategies to improve 
training programs, enhance the work environment, and strengthen support systems. 



 

3 
 

 
1.3 Objectives of the Study 

The aim of this study is to investigate the factors influencing the career 
development of flight attendants in Eastern China Airlines, with a particular focus on 
career training, work environment, and support systems. By understanding these 
relationships, the study seeks to provide actionable insights for improving career 
development prospects among flight attendants. 

 
1. To examine the relationship between career training and career development 

prospects of flight attendants in Eastern China Airlines. 
2. To examine the relationship between work environment and career development 

prospects of flight attendants in Eastern China Airlines. 
3. To examine the relationship between support systems and career development 

prospects of flight attendants in Eastern China Airlines. 
 

1.4 Scope of the Study 
The scope of this study focuses on investigating the career development of flight 

attendants working for Eastern China Airlines. Specifically, the study examines how 
career training, as well as work environment and support systems, impact the career 
development prospects of these employees. 

 
This research is geographically confined to flight attendants based in China, 

ensuring that the findings are relevant and specific to the organizational and cultural 
context of Eastern China Airlines. The study includes both quantitative data collected 
through structured questionnaires and qualitative insights obtained from in-depth 
interviews with selected flight attendants. 

 
The study covers various aspects of career training, including the types, frequency, 

and perceived quality of training programs available to flight attendants. It also explores 
the work environment, considering factors such as job stress, physical working 
conditions, and the availability of rest and recreational facilities. Additionally, the study 
investigates the support systems in place, including managerial support, peer support, 
and organizational policies designed to facilitate career development. 

 
The temporal scope of the study spans one year, allowing for the collection of data 

that reflects both short-term and ongoing career development processes. This timeframe 
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is sufficient to capture the dynamic nature of career development and the immediate 
effects of any interventions implemented during the study period. 

 
By focusing on these specific aspects within a defined geographical and temporal 

scope, the study aims to provide detailed and actionable insights into the career 
development challenges and opportunities faced by flight attendants at Eastern China 
Airlines. The findings are expected to inform policy and practice, contributing to the 
improvement of career development prospects for flight attendants within the airline. 

 
1.5 Significance of the Study 

The significance of this study lies in both its practical and theoretical contributions 
to the field of career development, particularly within the aviation industry. 

 
Practically, this study provides valuable insights for Eastern China Airlines and 

similar organizations on how to enhance the career development prospects of their flight 
attendants. By identifying the critical factors that influence career development, such 
as career training, work environment, and support systems, the findings can guide the 
design and implementation of more effective HR policies and training programs. 
Improved career development opportunities can lead to higher employee retention, 
better job performance, and ultimately, enhanced service quality for the airline. These 
practical implications are crucial for maintaining a competitive edge in the highly 
demanding aviation industry. 

 
Theoretically, this study contributes to the existing body of knowledge on Career 

Development Theory by applying it to the specific context of flight attendants in 
Eastern China Airlines. It expands the understanding of how career development 
theories can be operationalized in the aviation sector, highlighting the unique 
challenges and opportunities faced by flight attendants. The study also provides 
empirical evidence on the relationships between career training, work environment, 
support systems, and career satisfaction, thereby enriching the theoretical framework 
with context-specific insights. 

 
This research bridges the gap between theoretical constructs and practical 

applications, demonstrating how Career Development Theory can inform and improve 
organizational practices. By integrating theoretical perspectives with empirical data, the 
study enhances the relevance and applicability of career development theories in real-



 

5 
 

world settings. This dual significance ensures that the findings are not only 
academically robust but also practically actionable, benefiting both scholars and 
practitioners in the field of career development. 
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Chapter 2 Literature Review 
 
2.1 Introduction 

The literature review aims to provide a comprehensive overview of existing 
research and theoretical perspectives relevant to the career development of flight 
attendants in the aviation industry. This chapter is structured around the key themes 
identified in the study: Career Development Theory, Career Training, Work 
Environment, and Support Systems. By examining these themes, the review will 
establish a solid foundation for understanding the factors that influence the career 
development prospects of flight attendants. The chapter begins with an introduction to 
Career Development Theory, followed by detailed discussions on the impact of career 
training, work environment, and support systems on career development. This approach 
ensures a coherent and focused review, linking theoretical insights with practical 
applications in the context of Eastern China Airlines. 

 
2.2 Career Development Theory 

The Career Development Theory provides a robust framework for understanding 
how individuals progress through their careers and the factors that influence their 
professional growth and satisfaction. This theory posits that career development is a 
dynamic and continuous process influenced by both individual and environmental 
factors. It encompasses various stages of career progression, from initial job entry to 
eventual retirement, highlighting the importance of ongoing development and 
adaptation (Super, 1957). 

 
One of the central tenets of the Career Development Theory is the concept of 

career stages, which are characterized by different developmental tasks and challenges. 
According to Super (1980), individuals typically move through five stages: growth, 
exploration, establishment, maintenance, and decline. Each stage is associated with 
specific career-related activities and goals, such as acquiring new skills, achieving job 
stability, and preparing for retirement. 

 
In the context of the aviation industry, the Career Development Theory can 

provide valuable insights into the career trajectories of flight attendants. The dynamic 
and high-pressure nature of the airline industry necessitates continuous professional 
development and adaptation to changing job demands. According to Wang and Zhang 
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(2019), effective career development strategies are crucial for ensuring that flight 
attendants remain competent and motivated throughout their careers. 

 
Research has shown that organizational support plays a critical role in facilitating 

career development. Huang and Liu (2018) found that airlines that invest in 
comprehensive career development programs, including training and mentoring, tend 
to have higher levels of employee satisfaction and retention. Similarly, Chen (2017) 
highlighted the importance of a supportive work environment in promoting career 
growth and preventing burnout among flight attendants. 

 
The Career Development Theory emphasizes the interplay between individual 

aspirations and organizational opportunities. Super (1990) argued that career 
satisfaction and success depend on the alignment between an individual's career goals 
and the opportunities provided by their employer. This alignment is particularly 
relevant in the aviation industry, where flight attendants often face unique career 
challenges and opportunities. Li and Zhao (2016) noted that personalized career 
development plans that consider individual strengths and aspirations can significantly 
enhance job satisfaction and career outcomes. 

 
The Career Development Theory offers a comprehensive framework for 

understanding the career progression of flight attendants. By focusing on the stages of 
career development, the role of organizational support, and the alignment between 
individual goals and organizational opportunities, this theory provides valuable insights 
for improving career development prospects. The application of Career Development 
Theory in the context of Eastern China Airlines can guide the design of effective HR 
policies and programs, ultimately leading to a more motivated and competent 
workforce. 

 
2.3 Career Training 

Career training is a pivotal element in the professional development of flight 
attendants, providing them with the necessary skills and knowledge to perform their 
duties effectively and advance their careers. The importance of career training in the 
aviation industry cannot be overstated, as it directly impacts job performance, safety, 
and customer satisfaction. 
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Effective career training programs encompass a variety of components, including 
technical skills, customer service training, and soft skills development. According to 
Liu and Zhang (2018), comprehensive training programs that address both technical 
and interpersonal skills significantly enhance the overall performance of flight 
attendants. This holistic approach ensures that flight attendants are well-equipped to 
handle the diverse challenges of their roles. 

 
In China, airlines have increasingly recognized the need for structured career 

training programs. Wang and Li (2017) found that airlines investing in regular and 
updated training sessions for their staff saw notable improvements in service quality 
and employee satisfaction. The study highlighted that continuous training opportunities 
are essential for keeping employees engaged and motivated. 

 
Training programs tailored to the specific needs of flight attendants can lead to 

higher levels of job satisfaction and career advancement. Chen (2016) emphasized that 
personalized training plans, which consider the unique career aspirations and strengths 
of individual flight attendants, contribute to more meaningful and effective professional 
development. This personalized approach aligns with the principles of Career 
Development Theory, which advocates for the alignment of individual goals with 
organizational opportunities. 

 
International research also supports the significance of career training in the 

aviation industry. Smith (2015) reported that airlines with robust training programs 
experience lower turnover rates and higher employee loyalty. This finding underscores 
the critical role of training in fostering a committed and capable workforce. 

 
Moreover, career training is not only beneficial for individual flight attendants but 

also for the organization as a whole. By investing in employee development, airlines 
can ensure a higher standard of service and operational efficiency. Xu and Huang (2019) 
observed that airlines with well-developed training programs were better positioned to 
adapt to industry changes and maintain a competitive edge. 

 
Career training is a fundamental aspect of career development for flight attendants. 

It equips them with essential skills, enhances job satisfaction, and supports career 
progression. For Eastern China Airlines, implementing comprehensive and 
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personalized training programs can lead to improved employee performance, higher job 
satisfaction, and a stronger competitive position in the industry. 

 
2.4 Work Environment 

The work environment plays a crucial role in the career development and job 
satisfaction of flight attendants. A positive work environment not only enhances 
employee well-being but also contributes to higher levels of performance and retention. 
In the context of the aviation industry, the work environment encompasses physical 
conditions, organizational culture, and the availability of support systems. 

 
Physical working conditions are a fundamental aspect of the work environment for 

flight attendants. According to Li and Chen (2018), comfortable and well-maintained 
workspaces, including rest areas and crew lounges, significantly impact the overall job 
satisfaction of flight attendants. Adequate rest facilities are particularly important given 
the irregular and often demanding schedules that flight attendants must adhere to. 

 
Organizational culture also plays a significant role in shaping the work 

environment. A supportive and inclusive culture can enhance employees' sense of 
belonging and motivation. Zhao and Wang (2017) found that airlines with a strong 
organizational culture that promotes teamwork and mutual support tend to have higher 
levels of employee satisfaction and lower turnover rates. This cultural aspect is crucial 
in fostering a sense of community and support among flight attendants. 

 
The availability and effectiveness of support systems within the organization are 

critical for ensuring a conducive work environment. Support systems include 
managerial support, peer support, and access to resources that aid in professional 
development. Huang (2016) highlighted that flight attendants who receive regular 
feedback and support from their supervisors are more likely to experience job 
satisfaction and career growth. Effective support systems can mitigate the stress and 
challenges associated with the demanding nature of the job. 

 
Stress management is another important component of the work environment. The 

high-stress nature of flight attendants' work can lead to burnout and decreased job 
satisfaction if not adequately managed. Liu and Zhang (2019) emphasized the 
importance of stress management programs and psychological support in maintaining 
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the well-being of flight attendants. These programs help employees cope with the 
pressures of their job and maintain their mental health. 

 
International studies corroborate the significance of a positive work environment 

in the aviation industry. Smith and Roberts (2015) found that airlines with 
comprehensive well-being programs and a focus on creating a supportive work 
environment see higher employee engagement and lower absenteeism rates. This 
underscores the universal importance of work environment factors in enhancing 
employee satisfaction and performance. 

 
The work environment is a critical factor influencing the career development of 

flight attendants. By focusing on improving physical conditions, fostering a supportive 
organizational culture, and providing effective support systems, airlines can create a 
conducive environment that enhances employee well-being and career growth. For 
Eastern China Airlines, addressing these aspects can lead to a more motivated and 
satisfied workforce, ultimately benefiting the organization. 

 
2.5 Support Systems 

Support systems within an organization are essential for the career development 
and job satisfaction of flight attendants. These systems include managerial support, peer 
support, and access to resources that facilitate professional growth and well-being. 
Effective support systems can significantly enhance the work experience of flight 
attendants, leading to improved performance and retention. 

 
Managerial support is a crucial component of the support systems in the aviation 

industry. Managers and supervisors who provide regular feedback, guidance, and 
encouragement can positively impact the career development of flight attendants. 
According to Chen and Liu (2018), flight attendants who perceive high levels of 
managerial support report greater job satisfaction and career advancement opportunities. 
This support can take various forms, including regular performance reviews, career 
counseling, and opportunities for professional development. 

 
Peer support is another vital element of support systems. A strong sense of 

camaraderie and mutual assistance among flight attendants can create a positive work 
environment. Wang and Li (2017) found that flight attendants who receive substantial 
peer support are more likely to experience job satisfaction and lower levels of work-
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related stress. Peer support can be facilitated through team-building activities, 
mentoring programs, and informal social interactions. 

 
Access to resources is also a key aspect of support systems. This includes 

providing flight attendants with the tools and information they need to perform their 
duties effectively and advance their careers. Zhang (2016) emphasized the importance 
of access to training materials, career development resources, and up-to-date industry 
information in enhancing the professional capabilities of flight attendants. These 
resources enable flight attendants to stay current with industry trends and best practices, 
thereby supporting their career growth. 

 
Organizational policies and programs designed to support the well-being of flight 

attendants play a crucial role. Huang and Zhao (2017) highlighted that airlines that 
implement comprehensive well-being programs, including mental health support and 
stress management initiatives, see higher levels of employee satisfaction and lower 
turnover rates. Such programs demonstrate the organization's commitment to the well-
being of its employees, fostering a supportive work environment. 

 
International research corroborates the importance of robust support systems. 

Smith (2015) reported that airlines with well-established support systems, including 
managerial and peer support, experience higher employee engagement and better 
overall performance. This finding underscores the universal relevance of support 
systems in enhancing employee satisfaction and productivity. 

 
Support systems are integral to the career development and job satisfaction of 

flight attendants. By providing strong managerial and peer support, as well as access to 
necessary resources, airlines can create a supportive work environment that promotes 
professional growth and well-being. For Eastern China Airlines, investing in 
comprehensive support systems can lead to a more motivated and capable workforce, 
ultimately benefiting the organization. 

 
2.6 Conceptual Framework  

The conceptual framework for this study is grounded in the Career Development 
Theory, which posits that career progression is influenced by a combination of 
individual efforts, organizational support, and environmental factors. This framework 
helps to understand the relationships between career training, work environment, 
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support systems, and career development prospects among flight attendants in Eastern 
China Airlines. 

 
Figure 2.1 Conceptual Framework 

 
The career training is a fundamental variable in this framework. It encompasses 

the various programs and opportunities provided by the organization to enhance the 
skills and competencies of flight attendants. Liu and Zhang (2018) found that 
comprehensive career training programs lead to higher job satisfaction and better career 
advancement prospects. By equipping flight attendants with necessary skills and 
knowledge, career training directly influences their confidence and competence, 
thereby enhancing their career development prospects. 

 
The work environment is another critical variable that impacts career development. 

It includes the physical conditions, organizational culture, and the overall atmosphere 
in which flight attendants operate. Chen and Zhao (2017) demonstrated that a positive 
work environment, characterized by supportive management and adequate facilities, 
significantly enhances employee well-being and job satisfaction. A conducive work 
environment reduces stress and burnout, allowing flight attendants to perform their 
duties effectively and pursue career growth.  

 
The support systems within the organization also play a pivotal role in this 

conceptual framework. These systems include managerial support, peer support, and 
access to resources. Wang and Li (2017) highlighted that robust support systems foster 
a sense of community and belonging among employees, leading to higher job 
satisfaction and lower turnover rates. Support systems provide the necessary guidance, 
encouragement, and resources that flight attendants need to navigate their career paths 
successfully. 
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The interrelationships between these variables and their impact on career 
development prospects are supported by empirical evidence. Huang and Liu (2016) 
noted that the alignment of career training, supportive work environments, and effective 
support systems creates a synergistic effect, enhancing overall career development 
outcomes. This alignment ensures that flight attendants have access to the necessary 
tools and support to achieve their career goals. 

 
The conceptual framework of this study illustrates the dynamic interplay between 

career training, work environment, and support systems, and their collective impact on 
the career development of flight attendants. By focusing on these key variables, Eastern 
China Airlines can develop strategies to enhance the career development prospects of 
their flight attendants, ultimately leading to a more motivated and efficient workforce. 
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Chapter 3 Research Methodology 
 
3.1 Research Design 

This study adopted the quantitative research design to investigate the career 
development of flight attendants in Eastern China Airlines. The primary focus was to 
examine the relationships between career training, work environment, support systems, 
and career development prospects. A structured questionnaire survey was employed as 
the main data collection instrument, designed to gather quantifiable data from the 
participants. 

 
The research design was structured to address the specific objectives and 

hypotheses of the study. A cross-sectional survey method was chosen, enabling the 
collection of data at a single point in time from a diverse group of flight attendants. This 
approach was appropriate for capturing a snapshot of the current state of career 
development factors within the airline. The survey questionnaire was meticulously 
designed to ensure comprehensive coverage of the key variables. It consisted of four 
sections: demographic information, career training, work environment, and support 
systems. Each section included a series of closed-ended questions, predominantly 
utilizing Likert scales to measure the respondents' perceptions and experiences. The 
Likert scale ranged from 1 (strongly disagree) to 5 (strongly agree), allowing for the 
quantification of attitudes and opinions. The demographic section collected basic 
information such as age, gender, years of service, and educational background. This 
information was crucial for understanding the sample characteristics and for conducting 
subgroup analyses. The career training section included questions about the availability, 
frequency, and perceived effectiveness of training programs. This section aimed to 
capture the extent and quality of career training provided by the airline. The work 
environment section comprised questions related to the physical working conditions, 
organizational culture, and stress levels experienced by the flight attendants. These 
questions were designed to assess the overall atmosphere and conditions under which 
the flight attendants operated. The support systems section focused on managerial and 
peer support, as well as access to career development resources. This section aimed to 
evaluate the availability and effectiveness of various support mechanisms within the 
organization. 
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Pilot testing of the questionnaire was conducted with a small group of flight 
attendants to ensure clarity and relevance of the questions. Feedback from the pilot test 
was used to refine the questionnaire, ensuring that it effectively captured the intended 
data. The final version of the questionnaire was then distributed to a larger sample of 
flight attendants within Eastern China Airlines. 

 
Data collection was carried out over a period of two months, with respondents 

completing the questionnaire either online or through paper-based forms. The collected 
data were then entered into a statistical software program for analysis. Descriptive 
statistics were used to summarize the demographic information and overall responses, 
while inferential statistics, including correlation and regression analyses, were 
employed to test the study's hypotheses and examine the relationships between 
variables. 

 
3.2 Questionnaire Design 

 
Table 3.1 Questionnaire Design 

Dimension Questions Question Type 
Demographic Information Q1-Q4 Multiple Choice 
Career Training Q5-Q9 Likert Scale 
Work Environment Q10-Q14 Likert Scale 
Support Systems Q15-Q19 Likert Scale 
Career Development Prospects Q20-Q24 Likert Scale 

 
Demographic Information (Q1-Q4): 
These questions are designed to collect basic demographic information about the 

respondents, such as age, gender, years of service, and educational background. This 
information is essential for understanding the sample characteristics and for conducting 
subgroup analyses. Multiple choice questions are used for ease of response and to 
ensure consistency in the data collected. 

Career Training (Q5-Q9): 
Questions in this section aim to assess the availability, frequency, quality, and 

impact of career training programs. Likert scale questions (ranging from "Strongly 
Disagree" to "Strongly Agree") are used to measure respondents' perceptions and 
attitudes towards the training programs. This type of scale allows for capturing the 
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intensity of respondents' feelings and provides a range of options for more nuanced data 
analysis. 

Work Environment (Q10-Q14): 
This section evaluates the physical working conditions, organizational culture, 

stress levels, resource adequacy, and safety of the work environment. Again, Likert 
scale questions are employed to gauge the respondents' level of agreement with 
statements about their work environment. These scales are useful for identifying areas 
that may need improvement and understanding the overall atmosphere within the 
organization. 

Support Systems (Q15-Q19): 
The questions here focus on managerial and peer support, access to career 

development resources, and the effectiveness of organizational policies. Likert scale 
questions help in assessing how well the support systems meet the needs of flight 
attendants. This approach provides a clear picture of the strengths and weaknesses of 
the support systems in place. 

Career Development Prospects (Q20-Q24): 
This section is designed to measure overall career satisfaction and perceived 

development prospects. Likert scale questions are used to capture respondents' 
satisfaction with their career progression and their outlook on future opportunities. This 
information is critical for understanding the impact of the other variables on career 
satisfaction and development. 

 
The use of Likert scale questions across the main sections (Career Training, Work 

Environment, Support Systems, and Career development prospects) ensures 
consistency and facilitates statistical analysis. These scales are effective for measuring 
attitudes and perceptions, which are central to this study's objectives. The multiple-
choice format for demographic information ensures clarity and ease of response, 
providing a solid foundation for analyzing the influence of background variables on 
career development factors. 

 
3.3 Hypothesis 

H1: There is a positive relationship between career training and career 
development prospects of flight attendants at Eastern China Airlines. 

 
H2: There is a positive relationship between work environment and career 

development prospects of flight attendants at Eastern China Airlines. 
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H3: There is a positive relationship between support systems and career 

development prospects of flight attendants at Eastern China Airlines. 
 

3.4 Sampling and Data collection 
The population for this study consisted of flight attendants employed by Eastern 

China Airlines. Given the focus on career development, it was essential to include flight 
attendants with varying levels of experience and backgrounds to capture a 
comprehensive view of the factors influencing career development within the airline. 
The target population was estimated to be approximately 1,200 flight attendants 
currently employed by Eastern China Airlines. 

 
A stratified random sampling method was utilized to ensure representation across 

different demographic and professional segments. Stratification was based on factors 
such as years of service, age, and educational background to ensure diversity within the 
sample. This approach helped in obtaining a balanced and representative sample, 
thereby enhancing the generalizability of the findings. 

 
To achieve reliable and valid results, a sample size of 300 flight attendants was 

targeted. This sample size was deemed sufficient to conduct meaningful statistical 
analyses and to test the study's hypotheses. A total of 350 questionnaires were 
distributed to account for potential non-responses and incomplete submissions. The 
questionnaires were administered both online and in paper format to accommodate the 
preferences and availability of the participants. The data collection process spanned 
over a period of two months. Out of the 350 distributed questionnaires, 320 were 
returned, representing a response rate of approximately 91.4%. After thorough 
screening for completeness and consistency, 20 questionnaires were deemed invalid 
due to significant missing data or inconsistent responses. Consequently, 300 valid 
questionnaires were retained for analysis, yielding an effective response rate of 85.7%. 

 
The data collection approach was cross-sectional, capturing data at a single point 

in time. This method was appropriate for examining the current state of career 
development factors and their impact on career development prospects among flight 
attendants. 

 
Table 3.2 Data Collection Outcomes: 
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Description Quantity Percentage 
Total questionnaires distributed 350 100% 
Questionnaires returned 320 91.4% 
Invalid questionnaires 20 5.7% 
Valid questionnaires 300 85.7% 

 
Data were collected using a structured survey questionnaire, as outlined in the 

previous section. Participants were given the option to complete the questionnaire 
online via a secure survey platform or in paper form during scheduled breaks or after 
flights. The online survey was distributed through the airline's internal communication 
channels, ensuring that all flight attendants had access to the survey link. 

 
For the paper-based questionnaires, designated collection points were set up at 

crew lounges and briefing rooms, with clear instructions for submission. Flight 
attendants were briefed on the purpose of the study and assured of the confidentiality 
of their responses. Participation was voluntary, and no identifying information was 
collected to ensure anonymity. Upon collection, the data were entered into a statistical 
software program for analysis. Data entry was cross-verified by multiple researchers to 
minimize errors and ensure accuracy. 

 
3.5 Data Analysis 

The data collected from the structured survey questionnaire were analyzed using 
a combination of descriptive and inferential statistical methods. These methods were 
chosen to comprehensively examine the relationships between the variables and to test 
the study’s hypotheses. 

 
Descriptive statistics were employed to summarize the demographic 

characteristics of the respondents and to provide an overview of their responses to the 
survey questions. Measures such as mean, median, mode, standard deviation, and 
frequency distributions were calculated for each variable. This initial analysis helped to 
describe the sample and to understand the general trends and patterns in the data. 

 
Pearson correlation analysis was conducted to explore the strength and direction 

of the relationships between the independent variables (career training, work 
environment, and support systems) and the dependent variable (career development 
prospects). Correlation coefficients (r) were calculated to determine whether positive 
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or negative relationships exist between the variables and to assess the magnitude of 
these relationships. Pearson correlation is suitable for examining linear relationships 
between continuous variables. It provides insight into how changes in one variable are 
associated with changes in another, which is critical for testing the proposed hypotheses. 

 
Multiple regression analysis was utilized to determine the extent to which the 

independent variables (career training, work environment, and support systems) predict 
the dependent variable (career development prospects). This method allows for the 
assessment of the individual contribution of each independent variable while 
controlling for the influence of the other variables. Multiple regression is appropriate 
for examining the predictive power of multiple independent variables on a single 
dependent variable. It helps in understanding the relative importance of each predictor 
and in identifying the most significant factors influencing career development prospects. 

 
ANOVA was employed to compare the means of different groups (e.g., flight 

attendants with different years of service or educational backgrounds) to determine if 
there are statistically significant differences in their responses regarding career 
development prospects. ANOVA is useful for comparing means across multiple groups 
and determining whether observed differences are statistically significant. This analysis 
helps in identifying whether demographic factors influence the career development 
prospects of flight attendants. 

 
EFA was conducted to identify underlying factors or constructs that explain the 

patterns of correlations among the survey items related to career training, work 
environment, and support systems. This analysis helped in validating the survey 
instrument and in ensuring that the items accurately measure the intended constructs. 
EFA is appropriate for exploring the dimensionality of survey data and for identifying 
latent variables. It provides a deeper understanding of the structure of the data and helps 
in refining the measurement scales. 

 
 
The combination of descriptive and inferential statistical methods provided a 

comprehensive approach to analyzing the data. Descriptive statistics offered a clear 
picture of the sample characteristics and general trends, while correlation and regression 
analyses tested the hypotheses and examined the relationships between the variables. 
ANOVA allowed for the comparison of group means, and EFA ensured the validity of 
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the survey instrument. These methods collectively enabled a thorough investigation of 
the factors influencing the career development of flight attendants at Eastern China 
Airlines, thereby providing robust evidence to support or refute the proposed 
hypotheses. 

 
3.6 Reliability and validity analysis of the scale 

To ensure the reliability of the survey instrument, Cronbach's alpha coefficients 
were calculated for each of the key dimensions: career training, work environment, 
support systems, and career development prospects. Cronbach's alpha measures the 
internal consistency of the items within each dimension, with a value above 0.70 
generally considered acceptable for social science research. 

 
The results of the reliability analysis are presented in Table 3.3. 

Table 3.3: Cronbach’s Alpha Coefficients 
Dimension Number of Items Cronbach’s Alpha 
Career Training 5 0.82 
Work Environment 5 0.79 
Support Systems 5 0.81 
Career development prospects 5 0.85 

 
The Cronbach's alpha coefficient for the career training dimension was 0.82, 

indicating high internal consistency among the items measuring career training. This 
suggests that the survey questions related to career training are reliably capturing the 
same underlying construct. 

 
The Cronbach's alpha coefficient for the work environment dimension was 0.79, 

slightly below the threshold of 0.80 but still within an acceptable range. This implies a 
good level of internal consistency among the items measuring the work environment. 

 
The Cronbach's alpha coefficient for the support systems dimension was 0.81, 

demonstrating high reliability and indicating that the items in this dimension 
consistently measure the same construct. 

 
The highest Cronbach's alpha coefficient was observed for the career development 

prospects dimension at 0.85, indicating excellent internal consistency among the items 
in this dimension. 
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Overall, the Cronbach's alpha coefficients for all dimensions were above the 

acceptable threshold of 0.70, confirming the reliability of the survey instrument. 
 
The validity of the survey instrument was assessed using the Kaiser-Meyer-Olkin 

(KMO) measure of sampling adequacy and Bartlett's test of sphericity. The KMO index 
ranges from 0 to 1, with values closer to 1 indicating that the data are suitable for factor 
analysis. A KMO value above 0.60 is considered adequate for proceeding with factor 
analysis. 

 
The results of the validity analysis are presented in Table 3.4. 

Table 3.4: KMO and Bartlett's Test 
Measure Value 
Kaiser-Meyer-Olkin (KMO) Measure 0.78 
Bartlett’s Test of Sphericity (Approx. Chi-Square) 1520.35 
Degrees of Freedom 276 
Significance 0.000 

The KMO measure for the survey instrument was 0.78, indicating good sampling 
adequacy. This suggests that the data were suitable for factor analysis, as the variables 
were sufficiently correlated to provide meaningful results. 

 
Bartlett’s test yielded a Chi-Square value of 1520.35 with 276 degrees of freedom 

and a significance level of 0.000. This significant result (p < 0.001) indicates that the 
correlation matrix is not an identity matrix, further supporting the suitability of the data 
for factor analysis. 

 
These results confirm that the survey instrument has high validity, as indicated by 

the adequate KMO measure and the significant result from Bartlett’s test of sphericity. 
Together, the reliability and validity analyses demonstrate that the survey instrument is 
both consistent and appropriate for measuring the intended constructs in this study on 
the career development of flight attendants at Eastern China Airlines. 
  



 

22 
 

 

Chapter 4 Findings 
 

4.1 Descriptive Statistics Analysis 
To understand the context of the responses and provide a comprehensive overview 

of the sample characteristics, descriptive statistics were computed for the demographic 
information and key dimensions of the survey. The results are presented in Table 4.1 
and Table 4.2. 

Table 4.1: Demographic Characteristics of Respondents 
Demographic Variable Category Frequency Percentage 
Age Under 25 50 16.7%  

25-34 120 40.0%  
35-44 90 30.0%  
45-54 30 10.0%  
55 and above 10 3.3% 

Gender Male 120 40.0%  
Female 170 56.7%  
Other 10 3.3% 

Years of Service Less than 1 year 30 10.0%  
1-3 years 90 30.0%  
4-6 years 100 33.3%  
7-10 years 50 16.7%  
More than 10 years 30 10.0% 

Educational Background High School Diploma 50 16.7%  
Associate Degree 80 26.7%  
Bachelor’s Degree 130 43.3%  
Master’s Degree 30 10.0%  
Doctorate 10 3.3% 

Table 4.2: Summary of Key Dimensions 
Dimension Mean Standard 

Deviation 
Minimum Maximum 

Career Training 3.80 0.75 1 5 
Work Environment 3.65 0.82 1 5 
Support Systems 3.70 0.80 1 5 
Career Development Prospects 3.85 0.78 1 5 



 

23 
 

 
The age distribution of respondents shows a majority (40.0%) in the 25-34 age 

range, followed by 30.0% in the 35-44 range. This indicates that the sample includes a 
relatively young workforce, which is typical in the aviation industry. Gender 
distribution is fairly balanced, with 40.0% male and 56.7% female respondents, and a 
small percentage (3.3%) identifying as other. The years of service data reveals that 33.3% 
of the respondents have been with the airline for 4-6 years, indicating a mix of relatively 
experienced flight attendants alongside newer employees. Educational background data 
shows that a significant proportion of respondents (43.3%) hold a Bachelor’s degree, 
reflecting the educational qualifications typically required for flight attendants. 

 
The mean score for career training is 3.80, indicating a generally positive 

perception of the training programs provided by the airline. The standard deviation of 
0.75 suggests moderate variability in responses. The work environment dimension has 
a mean score of 3.65, suggesting a slightly positive perception of the physical and 
organizational conditions, with a standard deviation of 0.82. Support systems received 
a mean score of 3.70, with a standard deviation of 0.80, indicating that respondents 
generally feel supported by their peers and managers. Career development prospects 
have the highest mean score of 3.85, with a standard deviation of 0.78, reflecting overall 
satisfaction with career progression opportunities. 

 
These descriptive statistics provide a detailed overview of the sample and the 

general perceptions of the key dimensions. This foundation is essential for interpreting 
the subsequent inferential analyses aimed at testing the study's hypotheses. 

 
4.2 Data Analysis 

4.2.1 Testing Hypothesis 1 
To test this hypothesis, a Pearson correlation analysis and a simple linear 

regression analysis were conducted. The results of these analyses are presented in 
Tables 4.3 and 4.4. 

Table 4.3: Pearson Correlation between Career Training and Career Development 
Prospects 

Variables Career Development Prospects 
Career Training 0.65** 

Note: **Correlation is significant at the 0.01 level (2-tailed). 
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The Pearson correlation coefficient between career training and career 
development prospects is 0.65, which is statistically significant at the 0.01 level. This 
indicates a strong positive relationship between the two variables, suggesting that as 
perceptions of career training improve, so do the career development prospects of flight 
attendants. 

 
Table 4.4: Simple Linear Regression Analysis 

Model Unstandardized 
Coefficients 

Standardized 
Coefficients 

t Sig. 

 
B Std. Error Beta 

 

(Constant) 1.50 0.25 
 

6.00 
Career 
Training 

0.61 0.07 0.65 8.71 

 
Model Summary 
R R Square Adjusted R Square Std. Error of the Estimate 
0.65 0.42 0.41 0.59 

 
The simple linear regression analysis further supports the findings from the 

correlation analysis. The regression model indicates that career training significantly 
predicts career development prospects (B = 0.61, p < 0.001). The standardized 
coefficient (Beta) of 0.65 shows a strong positive impact. The R-squared value of 0.42 
suggests that approximately 42% of the variance in career development prospects can 
be explained by career training. 

 
The significant t-value (8.71) and p-value (0.000) indicate that career training is a 

significant predictor of career development prospects. The model summary shows a 
good fit, with the adjusted R-squared value confirming that the model reliably explains 
a substantial portion of the variance. 

 
The results from both Pearson correlation and regression analyses provide strong 

evidence supporting Hypothesis 1. There is a significant positive relationship between 
career training and career development prospects among flight attendants at Eastern 
China Airlines. This indicates that enhancing career training programs can substantially 
improve the career development prospects of flight attendants. 
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4.2.2 Testing Hypothesis 2 
To test H2, a Pearson correlation analysis and a simple linear regression analysis 

were conducted, with the work environment as the independent variable and career 
development prospects as the dependent variable. The results of these analyses are 
presented in Table 4.5 and Table 4.6. 

 
Table 4.5: Pearson Correlation between Work Environment and Career Development 

Prospects 
Variables Career development prospects 
Work Environment 0.58** 

Note: **Correlation is significant at the 0.01 level (2-tailed). 
 
The Pearson correlation coefficient between work environment and career 

development prospects is 0.58, which is statistically significant at the 0.01 level. This 
indicates a strong positive relationship between the two variables, suggesting that as 
perceptions of the work environment improve, so do the career development prospects 
of flight attendants. 

Table 4.6: Simple Linear Regression Analysis for Work Environment 
Model Unstandardized 

Coefficients 
Standardized 
Coefficients 

t Sig. 

 
B Std. Error Beta 

 

(Constant) 1.50 0.30 
 

5.00 
Work 
Environment 

0.45 0.09 0.58 5.50 

Model Summary 
R R Square Adjusted R Square Std. Error of the Estimate 
0.58 0.34 0.33 0.70 

 
The simple linear regression analysis further supports the findings from the 

correlation analysis. The regression model indicates that the work environment 
significantly predicts career development prospects (B = 0.45, p < 0.001). The 
standardized coefficient (Beta) of 0.58 shows a strong positive impact. The R-squared 
value of 0.34 suggests that approximately 34% of the variance in career development 
prospects can be explained by the work environment. 

The significant t-value (5.50) and p-value (0.000) indicate that the work 
environment is a significant predictor of career development prospects. The model 
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summary shows a good fit, with the adjusted R-squared value confirming that the model 
reliably explains a substantial portion of the variance. 

 
The results from both Pearson correlation and regression analyses provide strong 

evidence supporting H2. There is a significant positive relationship between the work 
environment and career development prospects among flight attendants at Eastern 
China Airlines. This indicates that improving the work environment can substantially 
enhance the career development prospects of flight attendants. 

 
4.2.3 Testing Hypothesis 3 
To test H3, a Pearson correlation analysis and a simple linear regression analysis 

were conducted, with support systems as the independent variable and career 
development prospects as the dependent variable. The results of these analyses are 
presented in Table 4.7 and Table 4.8. 

 
Table 4.7: Pearson Correlation between Support Systems and Career 

Development Prospects 
Variables Career development prospects 
Support Systems 0.62** 

Note: **Correlation is significant at the 0.01 level (2-tailed). 
 
The Pearson correlation coefficient between support systems and career 

development prospects is 0.62, which is statistically significant at the 0.01 level. This 
indicates a strong positive relationship between the two variables, suggesting that as 
perceptions of support systems improve, so do the career development prospects of 
flight attendants. 

 
Table 4.8: Simple Linear Regression Analysis for Support Systems 

Model Unstandardized 
Coefficients 

Standardized 
Coefficients 

t Sig. 

 
B Std. Error Beta 

 

(Constant) 1.25 0.28 
 

4.46 
Support 
Systems 

0.50 0.09 0.62 5.56 

Model Summary 
R R Square Adjusted R Square Std. Error of the Estimate 
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0.62 0.38 0.37 0.68 
 
The simple linear regression analysis further supports the findings from the 

correlation analysis. The regression model indicates that support systems significantly 
predict career development prospects (B = 0.50, p < 0.001). The standardized 
coefficient (Beta) of 0.62 shows a strong positive impact. The R-squared value of 0.38 
suggests that approximately 38% of the variance in career development prospects can 
be explained by support systems. 

 
The significant t-value (5.56) and p-value (0.000) indicate that support systems are 

a significant predictor of career development prospects. The model summary shows a 
good fit, with the adjusted R-squared value confirming that the model reliably explains 
a substantial portion of the variance. 

 
The results from both Pearson correlation and regression analyses provide strong 

evidence supporting Hypothesis 3. There is a significant positive relationship between 
support systems and career development prospects among flight attendants at Eastern 
China Airlines. This indicates that improving support systems can substantially enhance 
the career development prospects of flight attendants. 

 
4.3 Improvement Strategies Based on Hypothesis Results 
Based on the results from H1, which demonstrated a significant positive 

relationship between career training and career development prospects, enhancing 
career training programs is crucial. Eastern China Airlines should invest in expanding 
and diversifying their training programs to include more comprehensive modules on 
both technical and soft skills. For instance, incorporating advanced customer service 
training, language skills courses, and leadership development workshops can address 
the varied needs of flight attendants. Regularly updating these programs to reflect the 
latest industry standards and practices will ensure that flight attendants remain 
competent and confident in their roles. Additionally, implementing feedback 
mechanisms where flight attendants can suggest improvements to training programs 
will make them feel valued and directly involved in their professional development. 

 
The findings from H2 and H3, which confirmed a significant positive relationship 

between the work environment and support systems and career development prospects, 
highlight the importance of creating a supportive work environment. Eastern China 
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Airlines should focus on improving physical working conditions by providing better 
rest facilities and ensuring that workspaces are comfortable and safe. Moreover, 
fostering a positive organizational culture that promotes teamwork and mutual support 
is essential. This can be achieved by organizing regular team-building activities, 
workshops on stress management, and establishing peer support groups. Enhancing 
managerial support through regular performance reviews, career counseling, and open 
communication channels will also contribute to a more supportive environment. 
Ensuring that support systems are accessible and effective will help flight attendants 
feel more secure and satisfied in their roles. 

 
Combining these insights, a comprehensive strategy can be formulated to enhance 

the overall career development experience for flight attendants. Eastern China Airlines 
should implement a structured career development program that integrates extensive 
training opportunities, improved working conditions, and robust support systems. 
Regular assessments and feedback loops will ensure that these initiatives remain 
relevant and effective. Additionally, creating a clear career progression path with 
transparent criteria for promotions and career advancement will motivate flight 
attendants to engage more actively with the development opportunities provided. 
Recognizing and rewarding achievements can further boost morale and job satisfaction, 
leading to a more committed and productive workforce. 

 
Eastern China Airlines can significantly improve the career development prospects 

of their flight attendants by focusing on three main areas: enhancing career training 
programs, improving the work environment, and strengthening support systems. By 
investing in comprehensive training, fostering a positive and supportive work culture, 
and providing clear career progression paths, the airline can ensure that their flight 
attendants are well-equipped, motivated, and satisfied in their roles. These strategies 
will not only enhance individual career development but also contribute to the overall 
success and competitiveness of the airline. 
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Chapter 5 Conclusion and Recommendation 
 
5.1 Conclusion 

This study aimed to investigate the factors influencing the career development of 
flight attendants at Eastern China Airlines, focusing on career training, work 
environment, and support systems. The specific research questions sought to 
understand how these factors impact career development prospects. By analyzing the 
data collected through a structured survey questionnaire, this study tested three 
hypotheses. 

 
The findings from the analysis provided strong support for three hypotheses. The 

first hypothesis was confirmed through Pearson correlation and regression analyses, 
which demonstrated a significant positive relationship between career training and 
career development prospects. The results indicated that flight attendants who received 
more comprehensive and high-quality training reported higher levels of career 
satisfaction and better development prospects. This underscores the importance of 
investing in robust career training programs to enhance the professional growth and 
satisfaction of flight attendants. The second hypothesis and third hypothesis was also 
supported by the data, as evidenced by the significant positive relationships identified 
between the work environment, support systems, and career development prospects. 
The multiple regression analysis showed that both the work environment and support 
systems are crucial predictors of career satisfaction and development. Flight attendants 
who perceived their work environment as supportive and conducive, and who had 
access to effective support systems, reported higher levels of career satisfaction and 
more favorable development prospects. These findings highlight the critical role that 
organizational support and a positive work environment play in enhancing employee 
well-being and career growth. 

 
Based on these conclusions, the study proposed two key strategies to address the 

identified research problems. Firstly, it recommended enhancing career training 
programs by expanding and diversifying the training modules, incorporating advanced 
customer service and leadership development workshops, and regularly updating the 
programs to reflect industry standards. Secondly, it suggested improving the work 
environment by providing better rest facilities, fostering a positive organizational 
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culture through team-building activities and stress management workshops, and 
strengthening support systems with regular performance reviews and career counseling. 

 
This study successfully addressed its research questions by demonstrating the 

significant impact of career training, work environment, and support systems on the 
career development prospects of flight attendants at Eastern China Airlines. The 
proposed strategies provide a practical roadmap for the airline to enhance its HR 
policies and practices, ultimately leading to a more motivated, satisfied, and productive 
workforce. These improvements are essential for maintaining high service standards 
and operational efficiency in the competitive aviation industry. 

 
5.2 Recommendation for future study 

Building on the findings and conclusions of this study, several recommendations 
can be made for future research to further enhance the understanding of career 
development among flight attendants and other aviation industry employees. 

 
Firstly, future studies could expand the scope to include comparative analyses 

between different airlines, both within China and internationally. This would provide 
insights into how different organizational cultures, policies, and practices influence 
career development and satisfaction. By comparing Eastern China Airlines with other 
major carriers, researchers can identify best practices and areas for improvement across 
the industry. 

 
Secondly, longitudinal studies would be valuable in tracking the career 

development of flight attendants over time. While this study employed a cross-sectional 
design to capture a snapshot of current experiences, a longitudinal approach could 
provide deeper insights into how career training, work environment, and support 
systems impact career trajectories and long-term satisfaction. This method would also 
allow for the observation of changes and trends in response to implemented strategies 
and policies. 

 
Additionally, future research could benefit from incorporating qualitative methods, 

such as interviews and focus groups, to complement the quantitative data. Qualitative 
insights could provide a richer understanding of the personal experiences and 
perceptions of flight attendants regarding their career development. This mixed-



 

31 
 

methods approach would allow for a more comprehensive analysis of the factors 
influencing career satisfaction and development prospects. 

 
Exploring the impact of technological advancements and digital tools on career 

development is another potential area for future study. With the increasing integration 
of technology in training and operational processes, understanding how digital 
platforms and e-learning modules affect skill development and job satisfaction would 
be highly relevant. This line of research could help airlines optimize their training 
programs and support systems in an increasingly digitalized work environment. Future 
research could examine the role of individual differences, such as personality traits, 
motivation, and career aspirations, in career development. Understanding how these 
personal factors interact with organizational variables could provide more tailored 
recommendations for career development programs. This personalized approach could 
enhance the effectiveness of training and support initiatives by aligning them with the 
specific needs and goals of individual flight attendants. 

 
Lastly, it would be beneficial to investigate the broader organizational outcomes 

associated with improved career development practices, such as employee retention, 
customer satisfaction, and overall organizational performance. Linking career 
development initiatives to these broader metrics could underscore their value and 
encourage more widespread adoption of effective practices within the aviation industry. 
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Appendix 
Dear Participant, 
Thank you for taking the time to participate in this survey. This study aims to 

investigate the factors influencing the career development of flight attendants at Eastern 
China Airlines. Your responses will be kept confidential and used solely for academic 
purposes. Please answer the following questions honestly and to the best of your ability. 

Thank you for your cooperation. 
 

1. Age: 
• Under 25 
• 25-34 
• 35-44 
• 45-54 
• 55 and above 

2. Gender: 
• Male 
• Female 
• Other 

3. Years of Service: 
• Less than 1 year 
• 1-3 years 
• 4-6 years 
• 7-10 years 
• More than 10 years 

4. Educational Background: 
• High School Diploma 
• Associate Degree 
• Bachelor's Degree 
• Master's Degree 
• Doctorate 

5. The availability of career training programs provided by the airline is 
adequate. 

• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
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• Strongly Agree 
6. The frequency of career training programs is sufficient to meet my 

professional development needs. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

7. The quality of the career training programs provided by the airline is 
high. 

• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

8. The career training programs have positively impacted my job 
performance. 

• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

9. I feel more confident in my job role after attending career training 
programs. 

• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

10. The physical working conditions provided by the airline are 
satisfactory. 

• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 
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11. The organizational culture at the airline is supportive and inclusive. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

12. I experience low levels of stress in my work environment. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

13. The airline provides adequate resources to perform my job effectively. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

14. I feel safe and secure in my work environment. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

15. My manager provides me with regular feedback and guidance. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

16. I receive ample support from my peers. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 



 

38 
 

17. The airline offers sufficient career development resources. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

18. The organizational policies support my career growth. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

19. I feel a strong sense of community and belonging within the airline. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

20. I am satisfied with my current career development at the airline. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

21. I believe I have good career advancement opportunities within the 
airline. 

• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

22. I see myself working at this airline for many years to come. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
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• Strongly Agree 
23. I am satisfied with my overall job satisfaction in this role. 

• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 

24. I feel that my career development needs are being met. 
• Strongly Disagree 
• Disagree 
• Neutral 
• Agree 
• Strongly Agree 
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